
Trashketball!! 



FYI- How to Study for Your Exam 

• Look at the posted vocabulary on my website. 

• Review your guided notes & class powerpoints 
for this semester. 

• Look at everything on my website! 

 -These questions will be posted on there 
for review. 

 



Rules 
• Two teams 

• One member from a team will be asked a 
question. They may consult with their team for 
10 seconds. 

• If you get it right you get to shoot the ball into 
the trashcan for 1, 2, or 3 points… 

• If you get it wrong the other team can steal. If 
they answer correctly then they can shoot… 



Vocab 

Question: Define partition  



Vocab 

Question: What 3 religions were founded in 
India? 



Vocab 

Question: What is the word for people moving 
from rural to urban areas?  



Vocab 

Question: Why does Sikhism reject the caste 
system? 



Vocab 

Question: What internal earth process creates 
landforms such as mountains, valleys, trenches, 
& volcanoes? 



Vocab 

Question: What direction do lines of latitude 
run?  



Vocab 

Question: What is the term for wealthy people 
moving into poorer areas and changing the 
culture & character of a neighborhood?  



Vocab 

Question: Why does the United States have 
many products made in factories in poorer 
countries? 



Vocab 

Question: What type of government is ruled by 
a king or a queen?  



Vocab 

Question: What type of economy does North 
Korea claim to have? 



Vocab 

Question: What is the Orographic Effect? 



Vocab 

Question: Define subsistence farming 



Vocab 

Question: What is an example of a multinational 
corporation? 



Vocab 

Question: Define economic interdependence  



Vocab 

Question: What is the secondary sector of the 
economy (define and give an example) 



Vocab 

Question: What is a biome? 



Vocab 

Question: Harvesting crops like cotton from the 
ground would be considered what sector of the 
economy? 



Vocab 

Question: Define standard of living 



Vocab 

Question: What type of map is this: 

A map that shows the river systems of Africa. 



Vocab 

Question: Give an example of something that 
causes environmental degradation 



Vocab 

Question: What are push and pull factors?  



Vocab 

Question: What is a map key? 



Vocab 

Question: What is the difference between 
absolute and relative location? 



Vocab 

Question: What type of map is a would show 
the different religions in a country?  



Vocab 

Question: Define water stress 



Vocab 

Question: What are examples of renewable and 
non-renewable resources? 



Vocab 

Define theocracy 



Vocab 

Question: What type of map shows borders 
between countries and capitols?  



Vocab 

Question: What is infrastructure? 



Vocab 

Question: Give 2 reasons that people migrate to 
other places. 



Vocab 

Question: Siddhartha Gautama was a prince 
who was not satisfied with his rich lifestyle.  So 
he left his palace and founded what religion? 


